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This list contains the details of some of the holiday companies who provide 

holiday packages which may be suitable for older adults. Also, holiday 

packages specifically designed for disabled adults. 

 

Inclusion on this list does not constitute a recommendation by Age UK 

Solihull and we suggest you discuss your specific requirements with the 

individual companies before booking.  

 

Age UK Solihull recommends that you inform the tour operator of any long-

term health conditions or disabilities prior to booking and you take out travel 

insurance before travelling. 

 

 

  



 

Company What they say on their website 

 
Merton House Holiday Hotel 
Edde Cross Street, 
Ross-on-Wye 
Herefordshire  
HR9 7BZ 
 
01989 563252 
 
www. merton-house.co.uk 
 
email: merton.house@clara.co.uk 

 

Registered Charity No. 277171 

 
Holiday Hotel for the elderly, frail and 
people with disabilities. Ideally suited 
for guests requiring the use of a 
wheelchair.  Carers accompanying 
guests are very welcome. 
Excursions to the many attractive 
tourist spots around Ross-on-Wye are 
available, in our new, specially adapted 
coach.  You need not worry about 
transport to and from the hotel.  At an 
additional cost Merton House can 
provide a door-to-door transport 
service, including specially adapted 
vehicles to accommodate wheelchairs. 

 
The Bond Hotel 
Blackpool 
 
01253 341218 
 
www.bondhotel.co.uk 
 
email: reservations@bondhotel. 
co.uk 

 
The Bond Hotel provides fully 
accessible holidays for guests who 
may have a physical disability, learning 
disability or need mental health 
support. As the UK’s largest disability 
friendly hotel, we have many fantastic 
facilities to make your stay 
unforgettable, whether you are looking 
for a relaxing respite break or a fun-
packed holiday. 
 

 
Johnsons Coach Holidays 
Based in Henley in Arden 
Warwickshire 
 
01564 797 000 
 
www.johnsonscoaches.co.uk 
 
email:reservations@johnsonscoach
es.co.uk 

 
Includes our free door to door pick up 
from the Midlands area, travel in our 
'Club Class' coaches with extra leg 
room, dinner, bed and breakfast in 
carefully chosen quality hotels, all 
excursions and sightseeing listed in the 
itinerary and our coach holidays are 
escorted by a friendly courier. 
Johnsons provide a guideline grade for 
the hotel location accessibility in terms 
of steps, stairs, lift, hills, walking etc. 
The grades range from 1 to 5 and the 
higher the score the easier the hotel is 
for mobility. 
 

mailto:merton.house@clara.co.uk
mailto:merton.house@clara.co.uk
http://www.bondhotel.co.uk/


 
Grand UK Holidays 
Based in Norwich 
(closest pick-up point is Coventry) 
 
 
01603 886 767 
 
www.grandukholidays.com 
 
email: 
bookings@grandukholidays.com 
 

 
We specialise in escorted coach 
holidays and escorted tours for the 
mature traveller and all our coach 
holidays are accompanied by a Tour 
Manager. 
You’re never alone on an escorted tour 
and our Tour Managers help break the 
ice with other holidaymakers, so even 
if you are travelling solo, you will soon 
be forming lifelong friendships! 
We include admission fees, tickets, 
guided tours, and complimentary 
passes that other holiday companies 
charge extra for. 
 
 

 
Shearings 
Based in Rotherham 
Various departure locations across 
Solihull borough (some have a 
supplement of £20 per person). 
 
01709 249 698 
 
www.shearings.com 
 
Enquiry form on the website  
 

 
Our tours are fully escorted so from the 
moment you set off to the moment you 
return home, you’ll be looked after by 
our friendly drivers and tour managers.   
Enjoy hand-picked accommodation, 
comfortable coach travel, excellent 
itineraries with included and optional 
excursions and a range of flexible 
joining points for your convenience. 
 
 

 
Titan Holidays 
Based in Seaham 
 
0800 988 5800 
 
www.titantravel.co.uk 
 
email: 
reservations@titantravel.co.uk 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
Our award-winning collection of 
holidays covers all seven continents, 
with carefully planned itineraries 
ranging from rail journeys and river 
cruises to small-group adventures and 
trips exclusively for solo travelers. Door 
to door travel service is included on 
every one of our holidays.  If you have 
any mobility restrictions, disabilities or 
medical needs, our travel advisors can 
help you with your plans and ensure an 
enjoyable holiday. 

http://www.grandukholidays.com/
http://www.shearings.com/
http://www.titantravel.co.uk/
mailto:reservations@titantravel.co.uk


 
Dragonfly Holidays 
Based in Devon 
 
0800 018 8485 
 
www.dragonflyholidays.co.uk 
 
email: 
hello@dragonflyholidays.co.uk 

 
Dragonfly offers good quality, all-
inclusive UK coach holidays for over 
60s that are accompanied by a tour 
manager.  
All our holidays start from Hopwood 
Services in South West Birmingham 
with a door-to-door taxi collection from 
your home address in the West 
Midlands area. 
The coaches we use are comfortable 
with reclining seats, air conditioning 
and toilet facilities. Our tour manager 
will serve you with complimentary hot 
drinks throughout the journey and we 
make regular comfort stops en route. 
We create a full itinerary for every 
holiday (gently paced, of course) with a 
variety of carefully chosen daily 
excursions. All entrance fees are 
included in the holiday & a friendly tour 
manager travels with you to ensure 
that everything runs like clockwork! 
 

 
Silver Travel Advisor 
 
0800 412 5678 
 
www.silvertraveladvisor.com 
 
Enquiry form on the website 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
Silver Travel Advisor is the UK’s 
leading travel agent for the over 50s, 
dedicated to providing a wide range of 
holidays for every silver traveller. 
Whether you are looking for a city 
break, a beach escape, a cruise 
voyage or an adventure further afield, 
we’re here to support you throughout 
the holiday booking process. From 
initial ideas and inspiration, through to 
a tailor-made holiday quote, providing 
your travel documentation, and 
ensuring your holiday runs like 
clockwork.  
Our ethos ‘Tried. Travelled. Trusted.’ 
means you can be assured of genuine, 
first-hand travel advice and 
recommendations.  
 
 
 

http://www.silvertraveladvisor.com/


 
Revitalise 
A National Charity with Centers in 
Chigwell, Southampton & Southport 
 
0303 303 0145 
 
www.revitalise.org.uk/contact-us/ 
 
email: bookings@revitalise.org.uk 
 
 
 
 
 
Registered Charity No: 295072 
 
 

 
Revitalise provides respite breaks for 
disabled adults with care support 
tailored to their needs, in a hospitality 
setting – an innovative and refreshing 
alternative to traditional residential 
respite care.  We currently run 3 
accessible holiday centres in Chigwell 
in Essex, Southampton and Southport.  
Our centres cater for adults with a 
variety of different disabilities.  Each 
centre offers short breaks in a relaxed, 
holiday-style environment, with a 
variety of trips and activities.  Guests 
on our breaks are supported by 
volunteers who provide companionship 
and assistance. 
 

 
Enable Holidays 
Worldwide Travel 
Based in Birmingham. 
 
0330 380 6880 
 
www.enableholidays.com 
 
email: enquiries@enable 
holidays.com 
 

Award-winning disabled holiday 
specialists providing accessible tailor-
made holidays for wheelchair users 
with guaranteed adapted 
accommodation. 
Our carefully planned environments, 
comprehensive adaptations and extra 
special comforts are specifically 
designed with disabled 
holidaymakers in mind – especially 
wheelchair-users, their carers and 
families. 
 

 
Dancebreaks 
 
 
07856 500 162 
 
www.dancebreaks.com  
 
 
email: Paulh4d@me.com 
 

 
Everything about your holiday has 
been thought through from the room 
allocation to the table plan in the 
restaurant.  Your itinerary explains 
every aspect of the break and is sent 
to you around 7 days before the 
holiday.  All dance break venues have 
comfortable rooms, a fine ballroom 
with a good-sized wooden floor, 
wholesome food, and friendly and 
helpful staff. 
 
 

http://www.revitalise.org.uk/contact-us/
mailto:bookings@revitalise.org.uk
mailto:Paulh4d@me.com


 
Limitless Travel 
Based in Birmingham 
 
0800 711 7112 
 
www.limitlesstravel.org/ elderly-
senior-holidays  
 
Enquiry form on the website 

 
At Limitless Travel, we are proud to 
offer disabled friendly holidays in the 
UK, Europe and around the world.  
With care packages tailored to offer 
various degrees of support and special 
assistance, we aim to give everyone 
the chance to take a break - whether 
that’s on a disabled friendly UK coach 
tour or a fully wheelchair accessible 
holiday abroad. 
All of our disabled access holidays 
feature accommodation and transport 
that have been specifically selected for 
travellers with disabilities. 
 

 
Holiday & Dance 
Based in Buckingham 
 
01844 275 175 
 
www.holidayanddance.co.uk 
 
email: info@holidayanddance.co.uk 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
We believe in the famous saying 
‘Friendship Through Dance’ and the 
sharing of dance experiences on 
holiday very much enhances 
enjoyment with like-minded people. 
The benefits of the Holiday and Dance 
experience provides great satisfaction 
and with this in mind our range of 
dancing holidays whether weekend, 
mid-week or maybe weeklong festivals 
or overseas packages provide choice 
and opportunity. 
 

 
Saga Holidays 
 
0808 134 6141 
 
www.holiday.saga.co.uk/over-50s-
holidays 
 
Enquiry form on the website 
 
 
 

 
We’ve been creating holidays 
exclusively for over 50’s for more than 
70 years.  From relaxing hotel stays to 
cultural group tours, our varied 
collection is a perfect choice for 
anyone over 50 (a travelling 
companion can be over 40).  Every 
holiday has been meticulously planned 
by our expert team, who are 
passionate about finding new, exciting 
destinations and creating holidays full 
of unforgettable experiences tailored 
just for you. 
 

http://www.limitlesstravel.org/disabled-holidays/
https://www.limitlesstravel.org/disabled-holidays/wheelchair-accessible-holidays/
https://www.limitlesstravel.org/disabled-holidays/wheelchair-accessible-holidays/
http://www.holidayanddance.co.uk/
http://www.holiday.saga.co.uk/


 
H F Holidays 
Based in Hertfordshire 
 
0203 974 8865 
 
www.hfholidays.co.uk 
 
email: info@hfholidays.co.uk 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
HF Holidays offers over 260 guided 
and self-guided walking holidays in the 
UK, Europe, and beyond. As Britain’s 
only walking holiday co-operative, our 
mission is simple: connect like-minded 
people with a love of the great 
outdoors. 
Unlike any other walking company, we 
own and manage 16 country houses in 
some of the UK’s best-loved national 
parks and National Landscapes. 
Friendship, fun, fresh air, and the 
feelgood factor is always at the heart of 
what we do. Our focus on social travel 
means sharing your experiences with 
like-minded people. 
 
 

 
Solos Holidays 
Based in Worcester 
 
0208 951 2900 
 
www.solosholidays.co.uk 
 
email: enquiries@solos.co.uk 

 
Bringing solo travellers together on 
sociable group holidays that cater for 
all ages and tastes, our guests benefit 
from no single supplements, 24/7 
support, a dedicated Tour Leader and 
a ready-made group of solo travellers!  
When you come along with us, you 
might be solo. But you’re never alone. 
 

 
Disabled Holidays 
 
0161 260 2218 
 
www.disabledholidays.com 
 
Enquiry form on the website 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
DisabledHolidays.com is the UK's 
largest disability specialist travel 
agency.  Our easily searchable 
directory will enable you to find 
wheelchair-friendly holidays and 
accommodation for people with limited 
mobility or even pet friendly properties 
for people with hearing or visual 
impairments. We also take great care 
in arranging holidays for people with 
terminal illnesses, understanding the 
privilege and weight of responsibility 
that comes with providing this service 
to the highest standard. 
 
 

http://www.hfholidays.co.uk/
mailto:info@hfholidays.co.uk
http://www.disabledholidays.com/


 
Dance for Fun Dance Holidays 
 
01706 351 110 
 
www.danceforfun.co.uk/dance-
holidays-in-the-uk 
 
email: info@danceforfun.co.uk 
 
 
 
 

 
We specialise in Dance Holidays in the 
UK. 
From weekend dance breaks to 5-day 
dance holidays, you can holiday and 
dance with us here in the UK.  As well 
as expanding your knowledge of dance 
through our Dance Workshops each 
morning, you can also explore some of 
the most beautiful and interesting parts 
of the country.  In the evening, after 
dinner, with all your friends old and 
new, you can dance the night away in 
the lovely Ballroom that each hotel 
provides. 
 

 
Sunny Heart Travel  
 
0345 222 0459 
 
www.sunnyhearttravel.com/holiday
s/seniors-holidays 
 
email: sales@sunnyhearttravel.com 
 
 
 
 

 
Would you like to travel near or far, 
explore somewhere familiar or brand 
new, stay active or indulge in pure 
relaxation? From all-inclusive holidays 
for the over 60’s to coach holidays for 
the over 70’s, whatever ingredients go 
into your perfect holiday recipe, we can 
ensure they are added to the mix with 
the utmost care. 
Choose from our excellent range of 
hotel options that suit your individual 
needs in a multitude of magnificent 
destinations, alongside a broad 
itinerary of experiences available to 
inspire you. From fascinating 
sightseeing tours to a host of in-resort 
entertainment, culinary experiences 
and gentle exercise classes to get the 
body moving, we can ensure your 
holiday package is tailor-made for your 
every want and need. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

http://www.danceforfun.co.uk/dance-holidays-in-the-uk
http://www.danceforfun.co.uk/dance-holidays-in-the-uk
tel:0345%20222%200459
http://www.sunnyhearttravel.com/holidays/seniors-holidays
http://www.sunnyhearttravel.com/holidays/seniors-holidays


 
Newmarket Holidays 
 
0333 060 3572 

 

www.newmarketholidays.co.uk/holi
day-types/tours-holidays-for-seniors 
 
 
email: 
customerservices@newmarketholid
ays.co.uk 
 
 
 

 
There's so much more to our tours 
than just the places you'll visit.  
Carefully chosen accommodation and 
meticulous travel arrangements, 
guided excursions and unforgettable 
experiences in the company of a 
friendly tour manager.  
With transfers, excursions and many 
entrances included in the price you can 
relax and enjoy every minute as you 
see sights you've always dreamed of, 
visit "must-do" places of interest, gaze 
in awe at natural wonders, taste new 
foods, meet new people, and make 
new friends and new memories to 
treasure forever. 

 

 

 

tel:+443330603572
mailto:customerservices@newmarketholidays.co.uk
mailto:customerservices@newmarketholidays.co.uk

